
                                NOTICE OF SPECIAL MEETING / PUBLIC HEARING 
 
The Onekama Township Zoning Board of Appeals will hold a Special Meeting / 
Public Hearing at 2 p.m. on Wednesday – August 12, 2020 at the Onekama Township 
Hall, 5435 Main St., Onekama, MI. 49675.  The special meeting will be held to 
consider a proposed variance request for the properties identified by parcel number 
51-11-009-004-40 & parcel number 51-11-009-004-30. 
 
The property owner of both these parcels is seeking two separate variances, one for 
each parcel, from the Onekama Township Zoning Ordinance from a 50-foot side 
yard setback to a 15-foot side yard setback on both sides of their parcels.  This 
would allow the property owner to place a 1512 sq. ft dwelling and attached garage 
within the side yard setbacks of each of these parcels. 
 
The variance request and application can be found on the Onekama Township 
Website at https://www.onekama.info/township or by visiting the Onekama 
Township Hall. 
 
The Zoning Board of Appeals will hold a subsequent public meeting on Thursday – 
8/13/2020 at 9 am at the Township Hall - to approve the minutes of the 8/12/2020 
ZBA meeting.   
 
Correspondence can be sent by mail, or hand delivered to the Onekama Township 
Hall, 5435 Main ST., Onekama, MI. 49675.  Please, mark it ATTN: Zoning Board of 
Appeals.  All correspondence must be received by end of business day on the day of 
the meeting. 
 
NOTE:  This meeting will be held in compliance with health guidelines mandated at 
the time, including observing building capacity limits to ensure social distancing, 
thereby limiting the possibility of spreading infection of the Covid-19 virus.  Masks 
will be required.   
 
This notice is posted in compliance with PA267 of 1976 as amended (Open Meetings 
Act), MCLA 41.72 (2) (3) and the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) Note:  
Individuals with disabilities requiring auxiliary aids or services should contact the 
Onekama Township Board by writing or calling the following:  Shelli Johnson, Clerk 
– 5435 Main St. P.O. Box 458 Onekama, MI 49675.  Phone 231-889-3308 Ext: 201.   
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